RE: Luxe City Center Hotel Folio

Subject: RE: Luxe City Center Hotel Folio

From: Robert Buente </O=EXCHANGELABS/OU=EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE
GROUP (FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/CN=RECIPIENTS
/CN=C7B1814176124B59B21D8FDA30E507D8-BBUENTE>

Date: 11/16/2016 03:21 PM

To: Katie Kiefer <katie@southpark.la>

CC: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la>

Just transferred $7,500.00 into the debit card account. Don’t go to Nordstrom’s

Robert Buente

President/CEO

1010 Development Corporation
1001 South Hope Street

First Floor

Los Angeles, CA 90015

bbuente@l0l0dev.org <mailto:bbuente@l@l0dev.org>

213-749-0214 x202 (o)

213-749-3098 (f)

From: Katie Kiefer [mailto:katie@southpark.lal
Sent: Wednesday, November 16, 2016 3:07 PM

To: Robert Buente <bbuente@l0lOdev.org>

Cc: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la>

Subject: Re: Luxe City Center Hotel Folio

Absolutely, no rush. Thank you for checking.

Katie Kiefer
South Park BID
1100 S. Flower St., Suite #3400, Los Angeles, CA 90015

0. 213 663 1120

1of5 10/19/2018 08:53 AM



RE: Luxe City Center Hotel Folio

24/7: 866 560 9346

From: Robert Buente <bbuente@l0l0dev.org <mailto:bbuente@l®lOdev.org> >
Date: Wednesday, November 16, 2016 at 3:05 PM

To: Katie Kiefer <katie@southpark.la <mailto:katie@southpark.la> >

Cc: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la <mailto:ellen@southpark.la> >
Subject: RE: Luxe City Center Hotel Folio

I just tried to go online to transfer money from the operating account to the debit card
account and Wells Fargo webpage is down..probably getting hacked by the Russians!

I'll try again around 4:00. I don't think there is sufficient funds in the debit card
account to cover the balance on the Luxe bill. Hold off..they can wait a day.

Bob

Robert Buente

President/CEO

1010 Development Corporation
1001 South Hope Street

First Floor

Los Angeles, CA 90015

bbuente@1010dev.org <mailto:bbuente@l010dev.org>

213-749-0214 x202 (o)

213-749-3098 (f)

From: Katie Kiefer [mailto:katie@southpark.lal]

Sent: Wednesday, November 16, 2016 2:52 PM

To: Robert Buente <bbuente@l0l0dev.org <mailto:bbuente@l®lOdev.org> >
Cc: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la <mailto:ellen@southpark.la> >
Subject: FW: Luxe City Center Hotel Folio

Bob — wanted to check in on available funding in our account. I need to pay the remaining
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RE: Luxe City Center Hotel Folio

balance total of $2,149.16 to LUXE for the annual meeting. I used the CC to charge the
50% down and want to ensure we have sufficient funds before approving the charge.

Let me know. THX for the needed assistance.

Katie Kiefer
South Park BID
1100 S. Flower St., Suite #3400, Los Angeles, CA 90015

0. 213 663 1120

24/7: 866 560 9346

From: Walter Ramirez <Walter.Ramirez@LuxeCityCenter.com
<mailto:Walter.Ramirez@LuxeCityCenter.com> >

Date: Wednesday, November 16, 2016 at 11:50 AM

To: Katie Kiefer <katie@southpark.la <mailto:katie@southpark.la> >
Cc: Atsuki Glodowski <Atsuki.Glodowski@LuxeCityCenter.com
<mailto:Atsuki.Glodowski@LuxeCityCenter.com> >

Subject: Luxe City Center Hotel Folio

Hi Katie,
Attached please find the folio from your recent event. Please review the charges. Upon

your approval I will close out the account and send you a zero balance folio. Thank you
and hope to hear from you soon.

WALTER RAMIREZ | SENIOR ACCOUNTING Manager

T | 213.743.7647 <tel:1-213-743-7647> F | 213.743.6028 <tel:1-213-743-6028>
WALTER.RAMIREZ@luxecitycenter.com <mailto:WALTER.RAMIREZ@luxecitycenter.com>

1020 S. Figueroa Street, Los Angeles, CA 90015
Across From L.A. Live, Staples Center and Microsoft Theater
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RE: Luxe City Center Hotel Folio

GDS CODE: LE | Luxecitycenter.com <http://www.luxecitycenter.com/>

<https://www.facebook.com/LuxeCityCenter>

<https://twitter.com/LuxeCityCenter>

<https://instagram.com/luxecitycenter>
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RE: Luxe City Center Hotel Folio
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